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Director of Energy Management 
 
This is administrative work in providing system-wide leadership, planning, development, 
coordination and implementation of a comprehensive strategic plan and program that supports 
the University’s and State’s short- and long-range energy sustainability, carbon-neutrality and 
“net-zero” energy objectives.  The initiatives focus on all areas of energy sustainability, 
including carbon neutrality, clean energy, energy efficiency and management, and renewable 
energy. 
 
As a member of the Vice President’s senior leadership team, the manager is responsible for 
developing and implementing system-wide policies, procedures and practices in collaboration 
with senior leaders to make the University a model in carbon neutrality and energy 
sustainability both in the State and among higher education institutions nationwide; integrating 
energy sustainability initiatives and programs into all areas of the University including 
instruction and curriculum, research, student and community engagement, capital projects and 
facilities upgrades, and daily operations; collaborating with administrators and managers in the 
development and implementation of energy strategies appropriate for individual campuses; 
and developing a business model that will create and reinvest savings generated by the 
energy management efforts.  
 
Work requires extensive experience managing research and development projects in the 
electrical industry; extensive knowledge and understanding of current technology and best 
practices in the areas of sustainability, carbon neutrality and energy management principles to 
catalyze institutional transformation; and ability to generate and secure additional sources of 
funding to support initiatives.  Work involves considerable contact and collaborative approach 
with University leadership including senior executives and administrators, campus 
administrators, legislators, city and county officials, federal and state agencies, various 
industry organizations, and general public.  Work is performed with seasoned tact, diplomacy, 
initiative and sound judgment.  Work is reviewed by the Vice President for Administration for 
results and effectiveness. 
 
The managerial class Director of Energy Management is established effective  
February 16, 2016. 
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David Lassner 

President 
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